

DEPARTMENT: WATER RESOURCES-WATER TREATMENT PLANT	DATE/TIME: 04/25/2018 3:00 p.m.
DESCRIPTION: THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS TO THE STILLWATER WATER TREATMENT PLANT	SUA BID #08-17/18

		LIQUID FERRIC SULFATE	CHLORINE GAS	CARBON DIOXIDE	SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE	CALCIUM OXIDE	POLYMER (COAGULANT AIDE)	ANHYDROUS AMMONIA	LIQUID OXYGEN
BIDDER:	UNIT →	PER DRY TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER LB	PER LB	PER 100 SCF
Texas Lime Company, 5429 LBJ Freeway, Suite 230, Dallas, TX									
PO BID PRICE:						\$ 209.0000			
CC BID PRICE:						NO BID			
Arkansas Lime Company, 5429 LBJ Freeway, Suite 230, Dallas, TX									
PO BID PRICE:						\$ 232.5600			
CC BID PRICE:						NO BID			
U.S. Lime Company--St Clair, 5429 LBJ Freeway, Suite 230, Dallas, TX									
PO BID PRICE:						\$ 188.5000			
CC BID PRICE:						NO BID			
Airgas Specialty Products Inc., 2530 Sever Rd, Ste 300, Lawrenceville, GA									
PO BID PRICE:								\$ 0.8600	
CC BID PRICE:								\$ 0.8600	
Kemira Water Solutions, 4321 W. 6th St., Lawrence, KS									
PO BID PRICE:		\$ 432.3600							
CC BID PRICE:		NO BID							
Lhoist North America of Missouri, 5600 Clearfork Main, Suite 300, Fort Worth, TX									
PO BID PRICE:						\$ 274.4100			
CC BID PRICE:						\$ 274.4100			

STAFF PRESENT AT BID OPENING: ELIZABETH CHRZ, VICKI REED, BILL MILLIS, THOMAS NOVOTNY AND AMY NOYES

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED DATE AND TIME.

DEPARTMENT: WATER RESOURCES-WATER TREATMENT PLANT	DATE/TIME: 04/25/2018 3:00 p.m.
DESCRIPTION: THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS TO THE STILLWATER WATER TREATMENT PLANT	SUA BID #08-17/18

		LIQUID FERRIC SULFATE	CHLORINE GAS	CARBON DIOXIDE	SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE	CALCIUM OXIDE	POLYMER (COAGULANT AIDE)	ANHYDROUS AMMONIA	LIQUID OXYGEN
BIDDER:	UNIT →	PER DRY TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER LB	PER LB	PER 100 SCF
Hawkins, Inc., 2381 Rosegate, Roseville, MN									
PO BID PRICE:					\$ 998.0000		\$ 0.7350		
CC BID PRICE:					\$ 998.0000		\$ 0.7350		
DPC Industries Inc., PO Box 59, Cleburne, TX									
PO BID PRICE:			\$ 990.0000						
CC BID PRICE:			NO BID						
Mississippi Lime Company, 3870 S. Lindbergh Blvd., Ste. 200, St. Louis, MO									
PO BID PRICE:						\$ 264.3000			
CC BID PRICE:						NO BID			
Polydyne Inc., 1 Chemical Plant Road, PO Box 279, Riceboro, GA									
PO BID PRICE:							\$ 0.5100		
CC BID PRICE:							\$ 0.5100		
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC, 90 East Halsey Road, Parsippany, NJ									
PO BID PRICE:		\$ 306.6700							
CC BID PRICE:		NO BID							
Praxair Inc., 7000 High Grove Blvd., Burr Ridge, IL									
PO BID PRICE:				\$ 133.3500					
CC BID PRICE:				NO BID					

STAFF PRESENT AT BID OPENING: ELIZABETH CHRZ, VICKI REED, BILL MILLIS, THOMAS NOVOTNY AND AMY NOYES

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED DATE AND TIME.

DEPARTMENT: WATER RESOURCES-WATER TREATMENT PLANT	DATE/TIME: 04/25/2018 3:00 p.m.
DESCRIPTION: THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS TO THE STILLWATER WATER TREATMENT PLANT	SUA BID #08-17/18

		LIQUID FERRIC SULFATE	CHLORINE GAS	CARBON DIOXIDE	SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE	CALCIUM OXIDE	POLYMER (COAGULANT AIDE)	ANHYDROUS AMMONIA	LIQUID OXYGEN
BIDDER:	UNIT →	PER DRY TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER LB	PER LB	PER 100 SCF
Nalco Company LLC, 1601 West Diehl Rd, Naperville, IL							\$ 0.8800		
PO BID PRICE:									
CC BID PRICE:							\$ 0.8800		
Univar USA Inc., 8201 S. 212th, Kent, WA	NO BID								
PO BID PRICE:									
CC BID PRICE:									
GEO Specialty Chemicals, 9213 Arch Street, Little Rock, AR	NO BID								
PO BID PRICE:									
CC BID PRICE:									
PO BID PRICE:									
CC BID PRICE:									
PO BID PRICE:									
CC BID PRICE:									

STAFF PRESENT AT BID OPENING: ELIZABETH CHRZ, VICKI REED, BILL MILLIS, THOMAS NOVOTNY AND AMY NOYES

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED DATE AND TIME.