

DEPARTMENT: WATER UTILITIES-WATER TREATMENT PLANT	DATE/TIME: MAY 8, 2019 3:00 p.m.
DESCRIPTION: THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS TO STILLWATER WATER TREATMENT PLANT	SUA BID #07-18/19

		LIQUID FERRIC SULFATE	CHLORINE GAS	CARBON DIOXIDE	SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE	CALCIUM OXIDE	POLYMER (COAGULANT AIDE)	ANHYDROUS AMMONIA	LIQUID OXYGEN
BIDDER:	UNIT →	PER DRY TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER LB	PER LB	PER 100 SCF
Brenntag Southwest Inc., Rt 2, Box 352-200, Nowata, OK 74048									
PO BID PRICE:			\$ 695.00		\$ 1,660.00		\$ 0.509		
CC BID PRICE:			\$ 695.00		\$ 1,660.00		\$ 0.509		
Univar USA Inc., 8201 S. 212th, Kent, WA 98032-1994									
PO BID PRICE:	NO BID								
CC BID PRICE:	NO BID								
Praxair Inc., 7000 High Grove Boulevard, Burr Ridge, IL 60527									
PO BID PRICE:				\$ 137.35					NO BID
CC BID PRICE:				NO BID					NO BID
Mississippi Lime Company, 3870 S. Lindbergh Boulevard, St. Louis, MO 63127									
PO BID PRICE:						\$ 275.55			
CC BID PRICE:						NO BID			
Texas Lime Company, 5429 LBJ Freeway, Suite 230, Dallas, TX 75240									
PO BID PRICE:						\$ 224.82			
CC BID PRICE:						NO BID			
U.S. Lime Company-St Clair, 5429 LBJ Freeway, Suite 230, Dallas, TX 75240									
PO BID PRICE:						\$ 212.93			
CC BID PRICE:						NO BID			

STAFF PRESENT AT BID OPENING: ELIZABETH CHRZ, AMY NOYES, BILL MILLIS, KAMI KOONTZ, VICKI REED

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED DATE AND TIME.

DEPARTMENT: WATER UTILITIES-WATER TREATMENT PLANT	DATE/TIME: MAY 8, 2019 3:00 p.m.
DESCRIPTION: THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS TO STILLWATER WATER TREATMENT PLANT	SUA BID #07-18/19

		LIQUID FERRIC SULFATE	CHLORINE GAS	CARBON DIOXIDE	SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE	CALCIUM OXIDE	POLYMER (COAGULANT AIDE)	ANHYDROUS AMMONIA	LIQUID OXYGEN
BIDDER:	UNIT →	PER DRY TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER LB	PER LB	PER 100 SCF
Arkansas Lime Company, 5429 LBJ Freeway, Suite 230, Dallas, TX 75240									
PO BID PRICE:						\$ 241.73			
CC BID PRICE:						NO BID			
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC, 90 East Halsey Road, Parsippany, NJ 07054									
PO BID PRICE:		\$ 398.33							
CC BID PRICE:		NO BID							
Hawkins Inc., 2381 Rosegate, Roseville, MN 55113									
PO BID PRICE:					\$ 1,560.00		\$ 0.760		
CC BID PRICE:					\$ 1,599.00		\$ 0.779		
Pencco, Inc., PO Box 600, San Felipe, TX 77473									
PO BID PRICE:		\$ 493.33							
CC BID PRICE:		\$ 503.20							
Polydyne Inc., 1 Chemical Plant Road, Riceboro, GA 31323									
PO BID PRICE:							\$ 0.56		
CC BID PRICE:							\$ 0.56		
Kemira Water Solutions Inc., 4321 W. 6th St., Lawrence, KS 66049									
PO BID PRICE:		\$ 495.00							
CC BID PRICE:		\$ 520.00							

STAFF PRESENT AT BID OPENING: ELIZABETH CHRZ, AMY NOYES, BILL MILLIS, KAMI KOONTZ, VICKI REED

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED DATE AND TIME.

DEPARTMENT: WATER UTILITIES-WATER TREATMENT PLANT	DATE/TIME: MAY 8, 2019 3:00 p.m.
DESCRIPTION: THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS TO STILLWATER WATER TREATMENT PLANT	SUA BID #07-18/19

		LIQUID FERRIC SULFATE	CHLORINE GAS	CARBON DIOXIDE	SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE	CALCIUM OXIDE	POLYMER (COAGULANT AIDE)	ANHYDROUS AMMONIA	LIQUID OXYGEN
BIDDER:	UNIT →	PER DRY TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER LB	PER LB	PER 100 SCF
Nalco Company LLC, 1601 West Diehl Rd., Naperville, IL 60563							\$ 1.26		
PO BID PRICE:							\$ 1.26		
CC BID PRICE:									
Air Products and Chemicals, Inc., 7201 Hamilton Blvd., Allentown, PA 18195									\$ 0.52
PO BID PRICE:									NO BID
CC BID PRICE:									
ALTIVIA Chemicals, LLC, 1100 Louisiana Street, Houston, TX 4800									
PO BID PRICE:		\$ 450.00							
CC BID PRICE:		NO BID							
PO BID PRICE:									
CC BID PRICE:									
PO BID PRICE:									
CC BID PRICE:									
PO BID PRICE:									
CC BID PRICE:									

STAFF PRESENT AT BID OPENING:	ELIZABETH CHRZ, AMY NOYES, BILL MILLIS, KAMI KOONTZ, VICKI REED
-------------------------------	---

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED DATE AND TIME.